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The Creation of Man with Body and Soul: today’s challenges 
Uģis Sildegs (Riga, Latvia) 

The biblical doctrine of creation is a crucial one. It is a truth that holds our bones together. It 
is a truth that stirs our breath. We have to speak of the creation story where God Himself 
steps into the dirt to craft something new. Picture the earth, fresh from God’s hand, its rivers 
sparkling, its hills humming with life. On the sixth day, the Creator pauses, having spoken 
light, seas, and stars into being, ready to craft His crowning work: humanity (Genesis 1:3–
14). But now, He kneels. From the ground, He gathers dust. Yet in God’s hands, this dust, 
this clod, this earth becomes a human body. This body is God’s creation, no accident of 
chance, but a form deliberate and good, as Luther saw it, “wonderfully united” with what’s 
to come (LW 1:62). Simply put, this body is not an accident, but God’s good and perfect 
design.  

But a body without life is clay, not man. Here’s where the tale turns wondrous, and doctrine 
deepens. The Almighty drawing near the dust, His glory veiled in love. From His own being 
flows the breath of life, a divine wind that enters the nostrils of the clod (Genesis 2:7). 
Moses calls this breath God’s own, not mere air but the soul itself. Luther would say, “The 
whole man, soul and body, is God’s work” (LW 33:64). The doctrine stands: the soul is no 
floating spirit, no Gnostic escapee, but the life God gives, wedded to flesh so tightly that to 
part them is to end both. The separation means death.  

The man asks, with eyes wide open, what or who is he? Humble, frail, destined for ashes 
and dust. Yet more: man bears God’s image (Genesis 1:26–27). This image, while debated, 
reflects God’s relational, rational, and moral likeness, expressed through body and soul in 
harmony. It means: in body and soul, man reflects his Maker—not in pride, but in a divine 
form, a stamp of fidelity that sets him apart. Luther saw this as grace, not merit (LW 
31:352). So man’s likeness to God is our blessedness. The body’s curves, the soul’s longing
—they point to the invisible God, a masterpiece of dust and spirit working and playing 
together. Likewise, the church father Augustine in his City of God affirmed that the soul, 
though distinct, is not superior to the body but united with it by God’s good design. 

However, we should always be reminded—this life is not ours to claim. Every breath is a 
gift, held in God’s hand, as the Scriptures remind us (Psalm 100:3, Psalm 104:24). “The gift 
of our breath rests in His palm,” a thread tied to the Giver. Without His Spirit, we would be 
void—“earth, without form, empty, darkness upon the deep,” as it echoes Genesis 1:2. The 
soul, linked to higher realms, feels this pull, a mystery that makes us strangers to ourselves 
until we seek and find the First Cause: God Himself.  

Imagine a world where God’s hand withdraws, a world unstirred by His breath—a human 
figure, lifeless on a barren plain. No light dances in its eyes, no warmth pulses in its veins. 
This is man without God, and the sight chills the heart. Moses whispers a serious warning: 
without God’s influence, the whole man seems to be nothing but earth, without form, empty, 
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and darkness upon the face of the deep (cf. Genesis 1:2). Consider it now—the body, once a 
clod shaped by divine fingers, crumbles back to dust, shapeless and void. This paints a grim 
truth about humans: apart from God, humanity is mere clay, no spark within, no purpose to 
hold it fast. It is as if the earth reclaims what was never truly alive, a shadow of the creation 
God intended. 

Luther reminds us why these warnings are so serious: sin has corrupted the whole being, 
twisting both body and soul, turning man inward, away from his Maker (LW 31:352). 
Without God’s grace, the soul lies dormant, not soaring but sinking into the dust it joined. 
The body—its arms, its face—becomes a hollow shell, what J.G. Hamann has called the 
“hidden figure,” pointing to a “hidden person within” that fades without divine light. No 
breath animates it, no Spirit stirs it. It is a form, but not a life. It is a form stripped of vitality, 
a silhouette of life bereft of the divine spark. Like a tree withered at its root, man spiritually 
dead stands motionless, his heart a silent sepulcher, his eyes blind to the glory above. 

However, even in this imagined void, the memory of God’s breath still lingers, a promise 
that humanity was never meant for darkness. The body, though dust, still bears the soul God 
breathed into it. Luther points to grace—he points to the merciful hand of God which can 
breathe anew the life that sin has quenched: “God works through this flesh” (LW 31:352). 
This spiritual emptiness is not the end, but a warning—a call to turn back to the One who 
forms, enlivens, redeems. Without God, man is and remains earth, shapeless, empty—a deep 
shrouded in night.  

But this is no final word, only a shadow cast to reveal the truth: humanity’s identity, its 
purpose, hangs on the breath of God, the grace that refuses to let dust lie still. Yet, as we 
marvel at this divine design, we cannot ignore the forces that seek to unravel it. The biblical 
vision of humanity—body and soul united—stands in stark contrast to the fragmented 
philosophies of our age. These modern ideologies, echoing ancient errors in new forms, 
threaten to tear apart what God has joined.  

Chief among them is what Francis Schaeffer called the “two-story worldview,” a divided 
lens that splits truth into a lower realm of scientific facts (biology, matter) and an upper 
realm of moral values (choice, identity). This fracture, born of Enlightenment precision and 
Romantic longing, distorts our understanding of personhood and fuels moral crises—
abortion, euthanasia, hookup culture—where the body is reduced to a machine and the self 
reigns supreme. 

The moral challenges  

Thus, there is “below” and there is “above.” Here below, the body is mere biology, a fact to 
be studied, optimized, or discarded. And here above, the “person” reigns, defined by choice, 
feeling, or cognition. This dichotomy assumes the body belongs to the lower story, while the 
authentic self floats in the upper story. Here the world has separated what God joined 
together.  
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The challenges of this worldview unfold in stark clarity across today’s moral landscape. In 
abortion debates, the lower story measures a fetus’s cells—heartbeats, DNA—yet denies it 
personhood until the upper story grants cognitive or sentient status.  

Euthanasia arguments mirror the same divide. The body, racked by pain, is reduced to a 
lower-story “machine”—failing organs, measurable suffering. The person, aloft in the upper 
story, seeks dignity through choice, framing death as compassion. While proponents argue 
that choosing death preserves dignity, Holy Scripture counters that true dignity lies in God’s 
sustaining grace, even in suffering (2 Corinthians 12:9).  

Hookup culture, too, bears the two-story mark. Bodies are reduced to images—swiped in 
apps, used, abused and discarded—while the upper story’s “self” seeks pleasure free of all 
commitments. Sex, stripped of procreation or covenant, becomes merely a lower-story act.  

The two-story worldview fuels broader cultural tides. Modernism, enthroning the lower 
story, crowns science as truth—think of AI algorithms dictating health policies or genetic 
edits redefining “human.” Postmodernism, flipping the script, lifts the upper story higher, 
casting facts as cultural constructs. The further that goes, the more the truth is revealed: 
without God’s Spirit and influence, man is earth, empty, darkness upon the deep. Abortion, 
euthanasia, and hookup culture thrive in this void, each a symptom of a body/person split 
that denies Genesis’s unity. 

To all of that we confess that God shaped humanity with care, breathing life into dust to 
unite body and soul as one (Genesis 2:7). We are a unity. This is His beautiful design: a 
seamless whole of body and soul. Against abortion, we cherish the sacred life God sparks at 
conception; against euthanasia, we honor the body’s holiness in every circumstance; against 
hookup culture, we uphold love and sex as God intended, rooted in marriage and mirrored 
in His own self-giving. We reject the false divide that tears apart what God has woven 
together, standing boldly for His unified vision of humanity. 

Modern shadows of an ancient heresy 

Yet, this is not the only shadow cast across our time. Another ancient heresy, Gnosticism, 
reemerges in a modern guise, subtly weaving its divisive threads through our culture. 
Condemned by the early church, Gnosticism scorned the physical as evil, exalting the 
spiritual as divine. It whispered that matter is a prison, the body a flawed cage, and the soul 
the true prize, destined to escape a world crafted not by God but by a lesser, malevolent 
force. Most gravely, it denied the Incarnation—how could most holy God take on flesh, as 
John 1:14 proclaims? Instead, it claimed that Jesus merely appeared human, a phantom too 
pure for the taint of earth. Today, neo-Gnosticism takes new forms, no less fracturing, 
shaping secular tides and cultural trends with a disdain for the body and a longing to 
transcend its limits. 
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In this whirlwind of modern shadows—neo-Gnosticism’s rejection of flesh, the two-story 
worldview’s divided truth, postmodernism’s fluid mirages—we find a steady guide in 
Irenaeus (particularly in his work Against Heresies), the early church father whose battle 
against Gnosticism helps to light our path today. Irenaeus gazed upon creation through the 
radiant lens of Christ, the Word made flesh (John 1:14), seeing in Genesis not merely a 
beginning but a story woven by the Father through His Son and Spirit, Holy Trinity. For 
Irenaeus, John 1:3—“all things were made through him, and without him nothing was 
made”—rang clear: the God of Jesus Christ, not some demiurge, has shaped humanity from 
Eden’s dust with His deliberate love. When Genesis 2:7 sings, “God formed man, taking 
dust from the earth,” Irenaeus saw the Father’s hands—the Son and Spirit—kneading clay 
with divine care, and crafting body and soul as one. 

Irenaeus’s vision binds creation to redemption in a seamless thread. He saw the dust of 
Genesis mirrored in the mud Christ used to heal the blind man (John 9:1–12), proclaiming 
that the Word who formed Adam stooped again to touch earth, restoring sight, recreating 
and affirming creation’s goodness. This act, Irenaeus taught, reveals the “original fashioning 
of man,” where Christ, the second Adam, reclaims and perfects humanity’s story. His 
theology looks backward and forward: the incarnation and resurrection illuminate Adam’s 
birth, showing body and soul not as rivals but as God’s unified art, bearing His image 
(Genesis 1:26–27). To read Scripture otherwise, Irenaeus warned, is to miss the Christ-
centered truth that holds all things together. 

This ancient fight against Gnosticism speaks directly to our modern struggles. Neo-
Gnosticism, like its ancient predecessor, scorns the body as a mere husk, exalting the inner 
self as the true essence. In transgender narratives, this manifests as a view of the body as 
a neutral or even hostile shell, misaligned with the “real” self within. The soul—or, in 
modern terms, the self—becomes the arbiter of identity, while the body’s form, its 
chromosomes (XX or XY), or its biological design is deemed incidental, a canvas to reshape 
at will. This framing echoes Gnosticism’s claim that matter is a prison, detachable from the 
spirit’s truth. Yet, Genesis 1:27 declares that God created humanity “male and female,” 
weaving sexual difference into the fabric of His “very good” design (Genesis 1:31). 
Irenaeus, with his Christ-centered lens, would point to the incarnation—God taking flesh as 
a man (John 1:14)—to affirm that the human body is no accident but a divine gift, integral 
to who we are. To pit self against body is to fracture what God has joined, denying the 
harmony of His creation. 

This neo-Gnostic drift also touches debates around same-sex marriage, where the body’s 
procreative purpose is often sidelined. The biblical mandate—“Be fruitful and multiply” 
(Genesis 1:28)—roots human love in the physical reality of male and female, designed for 
union and new life. Yet, when love is abstracted into mere feeling or choice, detached from 
the body’s God-given telos, the physical fades into irrelevance. Neo-Gnosticism whispers 
that the body’s design is secondary, that the soul’s desires reign supreme. Irenaeus’s 
theology counters this by grounding human purpose in the Creator’s act: the same Word 
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who formed Adam’s dust (Genesis 2:7) entered flesh to redeem it, affirming the body’s role 
in God’s redemptive story. The resurrection promises not a disembodied escape but a 
renewed body on a new earth (1 Corinthians 15:44), where creation’s purposes, including 
sexuality, find their fulfillment. 

The “spiritual but not religious” movement carries this same shadow, chasing inner 
enlightenment while shrugging off the physical. Seekers turn to meditation apps, self-help 
gurus, or vague notions of “energy,” declaring, “My truth lies within.” This quest mirrors 
Gnosticism’s escapist salvation, where the soul seeks liberation from a world deemed 
unworthy. Physical community—church, sacraments, shared worship—is dismissed as 
unnecessary, replaced by a privatized spirituality that floats free of flesh and ritual. Yet, 
Irenaeus reminds us that God’s Spirit works through matter: the dust of Eden, the mud that 
healed the blind (John 9:1–12), the bread and wine of the Supper. The incarnation declares 
that God embraces the physical to redeem it, not to bypass it. To shun embodied worship is 
to miss the truth that body and soul together reflect God’s image (Genesis 1:26–27), 
designed for communion with Him and one another. 

Transhumanism pushes this neo-Gnostic impulse further, dreaming of a future where the 
soul—or consciousness—escapes the body entirely. Advocates envision “uploading” minds 
to digital realms, shedding flesh for “silicon immortality.” The body, reduced to a flawed 
machine, is seen as a barrier to transcendence, a relic to discard in pursuit of a “higher” self. 
This vision echoes Gnosticism’s myth of a flawed creation, crafted by a lesser force. Yet, 
Irenaeus’s voice cuts through: the Father of Jesus Christ, through His Word and Spirit, 
shaped humanity’s dust as “very good” (Genesis 1:31). The body is no prison but God’s 
temple (1 Corinthians 6:19), destined for resurrection, not replacement. Christ’s risen body, 
tangible and glorified (Luke 24:39), points to our future—a renewed creation, not a digital 
void. Transhumanism’s promise of salvation through technology denies the Creator’s design, 
trading God’s art for a sterile mirage. Postmodernism, too, amplifies these neo-Gnostic 
echoes, claiming truth is constructed, not found. This mirrors Gnostic myths of a flawed 
world, where human will reshapes reality to fit inner desires.  

Irenaeus equips us to confront these challenges with clarity and hope. Against transgender 
narratives and same-sex marriage debates, we affirm the body’s God-given form and 
purpose, inseparable from the soul. Against “spiritual but not religious” trends, we embrace 
embodied worship, where sacraments and community ground us in God’s truth. Against 
transhumanism, we proclaim the body as God’s masterpiece, destined for resurrection, not 
obsolescence. This Christ-centered reading of Scripture—where the Incarnation and 
resurrection illuminate creation—cuts through modern distortions, anchoring us in the 
unchanging Word (Hebrews 4:12). As we navigate these shadows, we stand firm: we are 
God’s dust, breathed-into life, redeemed by His Son, and called to live as His unified 
creation—fully embodied, fully His. 
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We confess that embodiment is no curse but God’s deliberate design—humanity as body 
and soul, not soul alone. Genesis 1:28’s call to “be fruitful and multiply” roots us in physical 
vocations: family, work, and care for creation, all flowing from our embodied nature. The 
resurrection, tangible and real, assures us of a future where our bodies, like Christ’s, will 
rise renewed (Phil. 3:21), not discarded and thrown away. Spiritual and physical disciplines
—prayer, fasting, worship, service—honor both body and soul, as Scripture urges us to love 
God with heart, soul, mind, and strength (Mark 12:30). 

To those swayed by neo-Gnosticism’s pull, we extend a gentle call: feel the weight of your 
flesh, the pulse of your heart, the ache of your loneliness. These are not flaws to flee but 
signs of a body God crafted with love, a body He entered to redeem, a body He will raise to 
glory. The Christian story—creation, incarnation, resurrection—offers the only true balm for 
their longing. It affirms that body and soul together were created in God’s image (Genesis 
1:26–27), designed for communion with Him and one another. The sacraments—Baptism’s 
washing, the Supper’s feeding, Absolution’s freeing—anchor us in this embodied grace, 
countering the world’s fleeting promises with the solid hope of Christ’s cross. 

The shadows of neo-Gnosticism may swirl, but they cannot dim the light of God’s truth. 
Against its lies, we stand with Irenaeus, Luther, and the cloud of witnesses who proclaim a 
God who kneads dust with divine hands, breathes life into clay, and redeems flesh through 
His own. We are His masterpiece—body and soul woven together—called to live, love, and 
hope in the One who formed us, sustains us, and will raise us anew. Let us confess this 
boldly, live it fully, and invite all to embrace the goodness of their God-given flesh, trusting 
the Creator who declares, “Behold, I make all things new” (Revelation 21:5). 

The Mirror’s Lie—Body Image 

Now, even as we stand in this truth, another shadow looms, distorting the beauty of God’s 
design: the tyranny of body image. This modern affliction twists how we see ourselves, 
turning the mirror into a liar that obscures the Creator’s handiwork. Where God beholds dust 
lovingly shaped, culture’s warped lens reveals only flaws, chaining us to ideals that betray 
the unity of body and soul. 

Moses tells us that God formed humanity from the earth, breathing life into clay to forge a 
living soul—body and spirit intertwined, bearing His image (Genesis 2:7). This is no mere 
frame but a masterpiece, declared “very good” (Genesis 1:31). Yet a modern curse distorts 
our vision: body image, the mind’s picture of our form, twisted by cultural demands. People 
become obsessed and fixated only on physical bodies, measuring worth by mirrors that lie. 
Where God sees dust well-formed, our distorted visions see only flaws. 

Statistics paint a grim picture: 95% of men and women grapple with body dissatisfaction, 
with young people and teens especially vulnerable and troubled. Taunted by peers, 
bombarded by media, nudged by family, they learn to despise their bodies, convinced that 
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weight, shape, or features define their value. “I’m not enough,” they say, even when their 
friends see beauty and brilliance in them. 

Social media, with its 4 billion daily users, pours fuel on this fire. Filters sculpt impossible 
faces, ads peddle flawless forms, and influencers parade curated perfection. The result is a 
relentless chase: skipped meals, grueling workouts pushed past exhaustion, or cosmetic 
surgeries—driven by “selfie dysmorphia” tied to filtered ideals. Eating disorders plague 
women with anorexia or bulimia; compulsive exercise grips gym-goers who overtrain, 
harming the body they seek to perfect. Some turn to substances, others to tattoos or scalpels, 
mistreating the flesh God called good. Instagram’s parade of polished images crushes 
spirits, yet Psalm 139:14 counters with a gentle truth: “I am fearfully and wonderfully 
made,” a divine whisper that shatters culture’s cruel mirror. 

We are not called to conquer our bodies but to dwell in them as God’s gift. The “cult of the 
young body,” as some call it, masks a subtle hatred of real flesh, treating the body as a tool 
to subdue rather than a treasure to steward. This “instrumentalizing” of the body breeds 
strife, not peace—more than a half of dieters relapse into worse health, chasing ideals that 
mock God’s design. Our embodiment is no flaw but a holy calling. Genesis 1:28’s charge to 
“be fruitful and multiply” weaves the body into vocations of love and labor: parenting, 
planting, caring for creation. The resurrection, promised in 1 Corinthians 15:44, glorifies 
this dust, not discards it, promising a renewed body on a new earth. The Spirit dwells within 
us (1 Corinthians 6:19), sanctifying every breath, hallowing the body frame culture bids us 
reshape. 

Culture’s mirror blinds us, spawning fear, shame, and disorders, but Christ’s salvation heals 
this wound. God’s image is not a form to sculpt but a divine life to live. Scripture rejects 
cultural dictates—men must be tall, women thin, faces flawless—and roots our identity in 
Christ, where we are “re-created” in Christ’s own likeness (Colossians 3:10). This truth 
transforms body image from a curse to a holy calling: please, care for your body, yes, 
indeed, but as God’s art, not society’s canvas. We honor our body through rest, nourishment, 
and movement, not to chase fleeting ideals but to steward the temple where God’s Spirit 
dwells. 

To those caught in the mirror’s lie, we extend a compassionate call: see your body through 
God’s eyes, not the world’s. The scars, the curves, the lines—they are threads in His design, 
fearfully and wonderfully made. The Christian story—creation, redemption, resurrection—
frees us from culture’s tyranny. Baptism washes away shame, the Supper feeds and 
strengthens body and soul, and Absolution speaks worth over our wounds. As Irenaeus saw, 
the Word who shaped our dust entered it to redeem it, and He will raise it anew. Let us reject 
the false mirrors of media and markets, embracing our bodies as God’s gift, living fully as 
His image-bearers, anchored in the One who calls us His own. 
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Consumerism and Materialism 

Furthermore, even as we affirm this truth, another challenge arises, clouding the vision of 
our God-given embodiment: the seductive pull of consumerism and materialism. This 
modern idol distorts the purpose of our bodies, reducing them to mere instruments for 
pleasure, status, or acquisition, and pulls us further from the Creator’s design. Where God 
shaped humanity to reflect His image in body and soul (Genesis 1:26–27), consumerism 
tempts us to define ourselves by what we own, wear, or display, fracturing the unity of our 
created purpose. 

Materialism whispers that worth lies in possessions: designer clothes, sleek gadgets, 
luxurious homes. It transforms the body into a billboard, a canvas to advertise wealth or 
success. Social media amplifies this lie, with influencers showcasing curated lifestyles that 
equate happiness with the latest trends. Studies reveal that 60% of young adults feel 
pressure to buy products to “keep up” with peers, driven by the pursuit of status-driven 
purchases. This relentless chase leaves hearts empty, bodies exhausted, and souls adrift, as 
people trade God’s calling for fleeting treasures that “moth and rust destroy” (Matthew 
6:19). 

This consumerist mindset echoes the neo-Gnostic disdain for the body’s true purpose, 
treating it as a tool to enhance rather than a temple to treasure and steward (1 Corinthians 
6:19). Fashion brands market “perfect” silhouettes, urging us to reshape our bodies to fit 
their molds—through diets, surgeries, or gym regimens that prioritize appearance over 
health. Rapidly changing fashion, producing 100 billion garments annually, contradicts 
Genesis 1:28 call to care for creation. Meanwhile, the tech industry peddles devices that 
tether us to screens, distancing us from embodied relationships and the physical world God 
declared “very good”. In this frenzy, the body becomes a means to an end, not a gift bearing 
God’s image. 

Yet, Scripture offers a clearer vision. The Creator who formed us from dust (Genesis 2:7) 
calls us to live as stewards, not slaves, of our bodies and resources. Jesus warns, “You 
cannot serve both God and money” (Matthew 6:24), urging us to seek first His kingdom, 
where true worth resides. The Incarnation—God taking flesh (John 1:14)—reveals the 
body’s sacredness, not as a status symbol but as a vessel for love and service. To those 
ensnared by consumerism’s lure, we speak with compassion: your body is not a showcase 
for wealth, nor your worth tied to what you own. Feel the restlessness of chasing empty 
trends, the ache of a soul seeking more than material gain. These are signs of a deeper 
longing—for the God who shaped you, loves you, and calls you His. 

We are called to live differently. Genesis 1:28’s mandate to “be fruitful” invites us to use our 
bodies for vocations that honor God—building families, serving neighbors, tending the 
earth. Practical disciplines—generosity, simplicity, Sunday rest—counter consumerism’s 
grip, aligning body and soul with God’s rhythm. Rejecting culture’s dictates—newer, bigger, 
better—we treat our body as a vessel for His mission. In a world chasing fleeting wealth, we 
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proclaim a richer truth: we are God’s masterpiece, body and soul, called to steward His gifts, 
trust His provision, and await His promise about making all things new (Revelation 21:5). 

The threat of technology 

Yet, even as we reject the hollow promises of materialism, another shadow looms, one that 
threatens to erode the very essence of our embodied humanity: the rise of technology’s 
dehumanizing grip. This modern force, with its algorithms, screens, and artificial 
intelligence, risks reducing our bodies to data points and our souls to mere computations, 
pulling us further from the Creator’s design. Where God crafted humanity as a living unity 
of dust and breath, bearing His image (Genesis 1:26–27), technology tempts us to trade our 
flesh for digital shadows, fragmenting the wholeness of our God-given nature.  

Technology, in its pleasant promise of convenience and connection, often delivers isolation 
and detachment. Over 5 billion people now spend hours daily tethered to screens—
smartphones, tablets, virtual realities—where relationships are filtered through pixels and 
presence is replaced by posts. Studies show that 40% of teens report anxiety linked to social 
media overuse, while adults average seven hours daily on digital devices, eroding time for 
embodied interaction. Algorithms curate our desires, predicting preferences with eerie 
precision, yet they strip away the mystery of the soul God breathed into us (Genesis 2:7). 
Artificial intelligence, heralded as a new frontier, now powers chatbots, virtual assistants, 
and even “digital companions,” blurring the line between human and machine. Some 
futurists claim that consciousness could soon be “uploaded” or replicated, echoing neo-
Gnostic dreams of escaping flesh. 

This technological tide carries a subtle but profound distortion: it treats the body as 
obsolete, a limitation to transcend rather than a gift to embrace. Virtual reality platforms 
invite us to inhabit avatars—idealized, ageless, untethered from physical constraints—while 
wearable tech quantifies every step, heartbeat, and calorie, reducing the body to a machine 
to optimize. The biotech industry, with its tools like CRISPR, a gene-editing technology, 
promises to redesign humanity itself, altering DNA to eliminate “flaws” or enhance traits. 
These innovations, while offering medical hope, risk echoing the Gnostic lie of human 
reengineering rather than divine redemption. By prioritizing efficiency and control, 
technology subtly demotes the body to a tool and the soul to a dataset, undermining the 
Creator’s design. 

Scripture, however, calls us back to our embodied truth. Humanity was designed for 
physical presence, not digital abstraction. Jesus, the Word made flesh (John 1:14), lived 
among us—touching, eating, weeping—affirming the body’s role in God’s redemptive story. 
The resurrection, promised in Scriptures, assures us of glorified bodies, not virtual avatars, 
on a new earth where we dwell with God (Revelation 21:1ff.). The Spirit indwells our flesh 
(1 Corinthians 6:19), making each body a temple, not a circuit to reprogram.  
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To those lost in technology’s glow, we speak kindly: feel the ache of loneliness behind the 
screen, the restlessness of a soul craving more than likes or metrics. These are whispers of 
your true calling: to live as God’s image-bearer, embodied and whole. The Christian story 
reorients this longing: creation roots us in God’s good design, redemption restores us 
through Christ’s flesh, and resurrection promises a future where technology serves, not 
supplants, our humanity. Sacraments remind us that God works through matter—water, 
bread, wine, flesh—not algorithms. 

We are called to engage technology with wisdom, not worship. Genesis 1:28’s mandate to 
“subdue the earth” includes stewarding tools for God’s glory: using tech to connect, heal, 
and create, but never to replace the embodied vocations of love, work, and worship. 
Practical disciplines—screen-free hours, face-to-face fellowship, sincere and serious prayer
—reclaim our bodies from digital distraction, aligning us with God’s rhythm. Scripture 
anchors our identity in Christ, where we are “re-created” to reflect His image (Colossians 
3:10), not a programmer’s design. This reframes technology: a servant, not a savior, 
enhancing our humanity rather than erasing it. Let us reject the lie that we are mere data, 
embracing our bodies as temples of the Spirit, living fully for the One who formed us.  

Mental health struggles 

Furthermore, the epidemic of mental health struggles wounds the heart of our embodied 
existence, distorting the unity of body and soul. Fueled by isolation, pressure, and a 
fractured sense of self, this crisis pulls us from the Creator who designed us for communion 
and peace. Where God breathed life into dust, forging a living soul to reflect His image 
(Genesis 2:7), mental health challenges cloud our minds, burden our bodies, and obscure the 
wholeness of His design. In order to heal, we must slow down, learn God’s rhythm, and 
anchor ourselves in deep trust and reliance on Him, as theologian Kosuke Koyama in his 
book Three Mile an Hour God urges, embracing the unhurried pace of the Creator who 
walks with us. 

The scale of this crisis is stark. Globally, over 1 billion people grapple with mental health 
disorders: depression, anxiety, and burnout leading the toll. In 2025, 25% of young adults 
report persistent loneliness; 40% of workers cite chronic stress from relentless demands. 
Social media, with its endless scroll of comparisons, deepens the wound—70% of teens tie 
declining mental health to online platforms. Trauma, loss, and societal upheaval further 
strain the mind, with 1 in 5 adults showing signs of post-traumatic stress. The body bears 
this weight: insomnia, fatigue, and chronic pain intertwine with mental distress, revealing 
the inseparable bond of soul and flesh. This suffering echoes the neo-Gnostic lie that the 
inner self can be detached from the body, ignoring the embodied reality of our pain and the 
need for healing of the whole person. 

Culture’s remedies often falter, offering quick fixes—mindfulness apps, medications, or 
self-help trends—that treat the mind as a circuit to reboot, not a soul to nurture. The mental 
health industry promotes solutions that, while aiding some help, rarely touch the deeper 
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hunger for meaning and connection. Stigma lingers—30% of those struggling avoid help, 
fearing judgment in a world that equates worth with productivity. This approach isolates the 
spiritual from the physical, sidelining the body’s role in healing and the community’s role in 
support. It rushes toward solutions, neglecting the slow, sacred work of restoration God 
invites us into. By fragmenting mind from body, we drift from the Creator’s vision of 
humanity as a unified whole, designed for trustful rest in Him. 

Scripture, however, beckons us to a truer path, one of slowing down to learn God’s rhythm. 
The Lord is our shepherd, leading us to rest by still waters (Psalm 23:1–2), restoring body 
and soul in His care. The God who formed us from dust and breath (Genesis 2:7) knows our 
frame, calling us to “cast all your anxiety on Him because He cares for you” (1 Peter 5:7). 
Jesus, bearing our sorrows (John 11:35), modeled an unhurried life, retreating to pray and 
lingering with the broken, trusting the Father’s timing (Mark 1:35). Jesus wept with Mary 
and Martha (John 11:35), in the end, enduring the cross’s anguish—showing that God enters 
our pain, not bypasses it. He modeled an unhurried life, retreating to pray, lingering with the 
broken, trusting the Father’s timing. To heal, we must rely on the One who shapes and 
sustains us. 

I cannot recommend (Japanese theologian) Kasuke Koyama’s liberation theology in general, 
yet I kind of like his critical call, urging us to reject the world’s frantic pace and embrace 
God’s “three-mile-an-hour” rhythm: the walking pace of Jesus, who moved slowly enough 
to see, touch, and heal. In a culture that demands constant hustle, slowing down becomes an 
act of trust, a reliance on God’s provision over our striving. Mental health struggles often 
stem from this mismatch: our bodies and souls, designed for God’s tempo, are strained by 
society’s relentless speed. Slowing down—pausing to breathe, to pray, to be present—
realigns us with the Creator’s design, where body and soul find rest in His care. This deep 
trust, Koyama teaches, roots us in the God who is not pressed or hurried by our chaos but 
walks with us, step by step, toward wholeness. 

To those wrestling with mental health struggles, we speak tenderly: your pain is real, your 
body weary, your heart heavy with unseen burdens. These are not signs of failure but 
consequences of our sin and cries of a soul longing for the God who shaped you, sees you, 
and loves you. Slow down and hear His voice, His Word in the stillness. The Christian story 
restores this hope: creation affirms your worth as God’s image-bearer, redemption through 
Christ’s suffering binds your wounds, and resurrection promises a future where tears are 
wiped away. Baptism washes you into God’s family, the Supper strengthens you with His 
presence, and Absolution speaks forgiveness over shame. Sacraments thus ground us in 
embodied grace, countering isolation with the tangible love of Christ’s body, the church, 
where we learn to rely on God and one another. 

A big part of the mental health crisis is spiritual. We are called to live as whole persons, 
mind and body united, trusting God’s rhythm. Genesis 1:28’s call to fruitfulness includes 
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caring for our mental and physical health—resting, seeking help, fostering community—as 
acts of stewardship. Practical disciplines—prayer, confession of sins, friendship, honest 
fellowship, time in nature—nurture the soul while honoring the body, countering culture’s 
quick fixes. Slow practices like Sabbath-keeping or shared meals teach us to pause, to trust 
God’s provision, and to rely on His strength. Scripture roots our identity in Christ, where we 
are “re-created” to reflect His peace (Colossians 3:10), not the world’s chaos. This reframes 
mental health: not a puzzle to solve, but a journey to walk with God and others, at His 
unhurried pace.  

Individualism vs. Community 

Yet, even as we seek God’s unhurried peace to heal our minds, another shadow stretches 
across our path: the erosion of authentic community. This modern drift toward isolation and 
superficial connection frays the bonds God wove into our embodied existence, distancing us 
from the Creator who designed us for communion with Him and one another. Where God 
shaped humanity from dust to live as a unified body and soul, bearing His image in 
relationship (Genesis 1:26–27), the loss of community fragments our purpose, leaving us 
adrift in a world that prioritizes individualism over the shared life He intended.  

The scope of this disconnection is profound. In 2025, over 30% of adults globally report 
feeling profoundly lonely, with urban centers, despite their density, breeding isolation at 
unprecedented rates. Social media promises connection but delivers shallow interactions: 
likes, comments, and emojis replace the warmth of face-to-face presence. Studies reveal that 
50% of young adults crave deeper relationships but struggle to form them, citing busyness, 
mobility, and digital distraction as barriers. The decline of communal institutions—
churches, civic groups, even family dinners—further unravels the fabric of togetherness: 
40% of households now eat meals alone, a sharp rise from a decade ago. This isolation taxes 
both body and soul, with loneliness linked to higher risks of depression, heart disease, and 
weakened immunity, underscoring the embodied nature of our need for others. 

Culture’s response often leans into individualism, echoing the lie that the self is sufficient, 
detached from the physical and relational world. Self-care trends, while promoting wellness, 
sometimes glorify solitude over community, urging us to “find ourselves” in isolation rather 
than in shared life. The gig economy with its temporary, flexible, or freelance jobs, 
employing 20% of workers in 2024, fosters transient relationships, reporting higher 
loneliness than traditional employees. Even churches, meant to embody Christ’s body, face 
declining attendance: 25% of congregations report fewer than 50 regular members, 
reflecting a broader cultural shift toward “spiritual but not religious” autonomy. This 
fragmentation treats relationships as optional, ignoring the truth that God created us for 
interdependence, where body and soul flourish in communion. 

In Scripture, however, we are given a different design and purpose. The God who formed 
humanity from dust and breath declared it “not good” for man to be alone (Genesis 2:18), 
crafting Eve to share in the vocation of stewarding creation (Genesis 1:28). Jesus Himself, 
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the Word made flesh (John 1:14), lived in community—eating, praying, and serving with 
His disciples—showing that God’s kingdom unfolds in shared life. The Spirit binds us as 
one body (1 Corinthians 12:13), indwelling each person (1 Corinthians 6:19) to build up the 
whole. We are shaped for fellowship, crafted by the Father’s hands—Son and Spirit—to 
reflect the Trinity’s own communion. To live apart from each other is to deny the image we 
bear. 

Community, of course, requires time: unhurried moments to listen, share, and bear one 
another’s burdens (Galatians 6:2). The world’s frantic pace, driven by schedules and screens, 
crowds out these sacred encounters, but God’s three-mile-an-hour rhythm invites us to 
linger, to rely on His provision for relationships as we do for daily bread. Trusting God 
means trusting His design for deeply interconnected community, where our bodies and souls 
find strength in mutual dependence. Slowing down to share a meal, pray together, or simply 
be present realigns us with the Creator’s tempo, where love, not efficiency, shapes our days. 

To those yearning for connection yet trapped in isolation, we say compassionately: feel the 
ache of loneliness, the hunger for a hand to hold, a voice to hear your story. These are not 
weaknesses but signs of your God-given design: to live in communion, as body and soul, 
with others. The Christian story restores this hope: creation affirms your pressing need for 
fellowship, redemption through Christ’s cross unites you to His body, and resurrection 
promises an eternal community where no one is alone. The Spirit unites us. Baptism 
welcomes you into God’s family, the Supper binds you to brothers and sisters, and 
Absolution heals the wounds of broken bonds. These sacraments ground us in embodied 
love, countering digital shallowness with the weight of Christ’s presence in His church. Let 
us reject the lie that we are meant for solitude, embracing our whole selves as part of 
Christ’s body, living fully for the One who formed us. 

We are called to live as one body, body and soul united in shared purpose. Genesis 1:28’s 
call to fruitfulness includes building communities—families, churches, neighborhoods—
where love and service reflect God’s image. Practical disciplines, such as hospitality, 
smaller communities, volunteering, and unplugging from screens, nurture connection, 
countering culture’s individualism. Slow practices like communal worship, family devotions 
and biblical storytelling teach us to trust God’s provision for relationships and rely on His 
Spirit to knit us together. Scripture roots our identity in Christ, where we are “re-created” to 
belong to one another (Colossians 3:10), not to stand alone. We are called to embody God’s 
love, walking together at His pace. 

The Gift of Friendship 

Yet, even as we seek the communal bonds of Christ’s body, another shadow dims our path: 
the erosion of authentic friendship. In an age where relationships are vital for mission, 
outreach and evangelism, as leaders emphasize, we increasingly rely on impersonal digital 
means—texts, likes, virtual chats—to forge connections, distancing us from the embodied 
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intimacy God designed for friendship. Where God shaped humanity to bear His image in 
relational unity (Genesis 1:26–27), the loss of true friendship fragments our purpose, 
leaving souls craving the face-to-face love that reflects His heart.   

Friendship, rooted in Trinitarian communion, is no mere luxury but a divine gift woven into 
our embodied existence. In 2025, 60% of adults report having fewer than three close 
friends, a sharp decline from a decade ago, with 35% of young adults citing social media as 
primary “connection” tool. Yet, studies show that those relying on digital platforms for 
relationships feel emotionally unfulfilled, longing for the warmth of physical presence. 
Missionary “gurus” note that authentic relationships are the cornerstone of bringing people 
into faith: 70% of new believers cite a trusted friend’s influence as pivotal to their 
conversion. Impersonal outreach—mass emails, automated church apps, or social media ads
—yields very little engagement compared to personal invitations. God calls us to embody 
physical presence.   

Scripture reveals friendship as a sacred calling. Jesus, the Word made flesh (John 1:14), 
called His disciples “friends” (John 15:15), sharing meals, tears, and prayers in embodied 
intimacy. Proverbs 17:17 declares, “A friend loves at all times,” reflecting God’s steadfast 
love. David and Jonathan’s covenant bond (1 Samuel 18:1–3) models friendship as soul-knit 
loyalty, a physical and spiritual unity mirroring the Trinity’s communion. The early church 
thrived on such bonds, breaking bread house to house (Acts 2:46), their friendships a 
beacon to a fractured world. These relationships, requiring time and presence fostering 
unhurried love, counter the world’s rush and digital shallowness.   

To those yearning for true friendship, we speak with love: feel the ache of shallow chats, the 
hunger for a friend who sees you. These are signs of your God-given design—to love and be 
loved in body and soul. The Christian story restores this hope: creation affirms your 
relational nature, redemption through Christ’s cross binds you to His friends, and 
resurrection promises an eternal fellowship. Baptism welcomes you into God’s family, the 
Supper gathers you with friends at His table, and Absolution heals the wounds of broken 
trust. Practical disciplines—hospitality at home and in church, or simply sharing coffee—
nurture friendship’s embodied joy. Slow practices like listening without screens or praying 
together teach us to trust God’s provision for relationships, relying on His Spirit to knit 
hearts. Let us reject the lie of digital substitutes, embracing friendship as a witness to 
Christ’s love, walking together at His pace. 

Sacramental life  

To summarize the overall message, Scripture reveals the sacramental heart of God’s work. 
The God who formed humanity from dust and breath used physical means to sustain His 
people: manna in the desert (Exodus 16:4) and water from the rock (Numbers 20:11). Jesus, 
the Word made flesh (John 1:14), healed with touch, spit, and mud (John 9:6), showing that 
God’s grace flows through matter. His institution of Baptism (Matthew 28:19) and the 
Supper (Luke 22:19–20) ties salvation to tangible elements, affirming the body’s role in 
redemption. The resurrection, promised in 1 Corinthians 15:44, points to a new earth where 
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our glorified bodies partake in eternal worship (Revelation 21:3), not a disembodied escape. 
The Spirit, indwelling our flesh (1 Corinthians 6:19), enlivens these sacraments, making 
them “visible words,” as Augustine called them, that proclaim Christ’s victory. Irenaeus, 
with his Christ-centered vision, saw creation’s dust as sanctified by the Incarnation, where 
God embraced matter to redeem it, making sacraments the natural extension of His love.  

The world’s frantic pace—driven by schedules, screens, and self-reliance—leaves no room 
for the slow, deliberate grace of God’s gifts. Sacraments invite us to pause, to receive, to 
rely on God’s provision rather than our efforts. Baptism, received once, calls us to rest in 
our identity as God’s children for the rest of our life, trusting His covenant. The Supper, 
received regularly, slows us to savor Christ’s presence, relying on His nourishment. 
Absolution, delivered in confession, teaches us to wait on God’s mercy, trusting His 
forgiveness. This unhurried rhythm of sacramental life aligns body and soul with the 
Creator’s tempo, where grace flows not through our striving but through His faithful 
promise.  

Let us reject the lie that spirituality is merely inward, because true faith embraces our whole 
selves as vessels of His grace, living fully for the One who formed us. We are called to live 
sacramentally, body and soul united in God’s grace. We are called to participate in these 
practices, offering our bodies in worship (Romans 12:1) as we receive His mercy. Practical 
disciplines—regular church attendance at sacramental services, private confession, teaching 
children the rites—nurture the soul while engaging the body, countering culture’s spiritual 
shallowness. Slow practices like reflecting on one’s Baptism, meditating on the Supper’s 
promise, or lingering in Absolution’s assurance teach us to trust God’s provision and rely on 
His Spirit, not our inventions.  

Conclusion  

Amid all the shadows we have mentioned, the Gospel stands as a rock, unmoved by time. 
God’s sovereignty shines in creation’s hum, where every birth bears His breath, every labor 
moves by His might (Psalm 46:1). Though global conflicts rage, and our reason sees chaos, 
Christ gathers all things in His time (Ephesians 1:10). Genesis 1:28 calls us to care for the 
world—planting gardens, building homes, spreading kindness—but Romans 7:18 reminds 
us our hearts need His grace to trust God’s rule, guided by His wisdom.  

The sacraments—Baptism, the Lord’s Supper, and Absolution—embody this gospel, 
countering the world’s lies with God’s touch. They join us to Christ, body and soul, healing 
the fracture sin introduced. The shadows of postmodernism, transhumanism, and 
technology’s idolatry tempt us to redefine, escape, or diminish our bodies, but the gospel 
calls us back to our true identity: God’s dust, breathed into life, redeemed by His Son, and 
destined for resurrection. Against the mirage of constructed truths, Genesis 1:27 roots us in 
God’s design: “male and female,” body and soul, one in Christ (Colossians 3:10). Against 
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dreams of digital ghosts, the Spirit dwells in our flesh (1 Corinthians 6:19), affirming its 
dignity. Against tech’s relentless tick, there is a call to slow down in order to trust God’s 
three-mile-an-hour rhythm, relying on His provision as we walk in His love. 

Sacramental practices anchor this life. Baptism washes away the world’s lies, declaring us 
God’s children. The Supper feeds our hunger for presence, uniting us to Christ’s body. 
Absolution frees us from shame, speaking worth over our wounds. These gifts, Luther 
insists, are God’s real touch—water, bread, wine, and words—binding body and soul in His 
redemptive plan (LW 31:351). They counter the emptiness of secular spirituality, the 
isolation of digital communities, and the anxiety of permissiveness, offering a love that tech 
cannot match (1 John 4:19). 

As Christians, we live mindfully, using technology as a servant, not a god, as Luther saw 
tools as holy when serving God’s purposes (LW 1:103). We plant gardens, share stories, and 
pray, trusting God’s sovereignty while taking faithful steps (Psalm 90:12). When screens 
scream “be yourself,” Christ calls us to “deny ourselves” (Luke 9:23), finding true life in 
Him (Galatians 6:2). Against the world’s rush, we slow down—lingering over meals, 
folding hands in prayer, serving neighbors—rooted in God’s time, not tech’s hurry. 
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